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The question of where to file a bankruptcy case does not always have an obvious answer. The
debtor may be incorporated in a state other than where its operations are located or where it is
headquartered. Where there are multiple related debtors filing cases at the same time, the question
becomes even more complex.

For creditors and other interested parties, the question arises as to what can be done in cases where
the debtor’s chosen venue may be improper or objectionable. To understand how to address these
questions, one needs to understand the venue provisions and the procedure for seeking transfer of a
case.

A. Applicable Provisions of the Judicial Code

Venue in a bankruptcy case is governed by § 1408 of title 28 of the U.S. Code. 1 Section 1408
provides that a debtor may file its bankruptcy case (1) in any district court where the debtor’s
domicile, residence, principal place of business, or principal assets are located, or (2) in any district
court where an affiliate, general partner, or partnership of the debtor has a case pending.2 This
statute often gives a debtor—particularly a commercial debtor—several potential filing locations.
Accordingly, planning for a chapter 11 filing routinely includes an analysis to identify the most
appropriate venue.

While § 1408 and related case law provide debtors significant flexibility in selecting venue, that
power is not unlimited. A party in interest may request a transfer of venue or the court may transfer
venue sua sponte. The statutory bases for transferring venue are 28 U.S.C. §§ 1404, 1406 and



1412. Each of the statutes uses similar language regarding transferring venue for convenience
and/or in the interests of justice. Additionally, Bankruptcy Rule 1014 allows for the transfer of a
bankruptcy case following its commencement if the venue is found to be improper or, even if
proper, for other reasons that generally mirror the statutory bases, including if the transfer is “in the
interest of justice or for the convenience of the parties.”

B. Rule 1014 Generally

Bankruptcy Rule 10143 is divided into two parts. The first part governs the transfer or dismissal of
cases filed in a proper, but inconvenient, district or an improper district. Specifically, Bankruptcy
Rule 1014(a)(1) provides that, if the case was filed in the proper district, on a timely motion by a
party in interest or by its own motion, the court may transfer a case to any other district in the
interest of justice or for the convenience of the parties. In 2007, Bankruptcy Rule 1014 was
amended to clarify that the court could sua sponte transfer venue. The prior rule did not include the
language allowing the court to transfer venue by its own motion, so the amendment laid any doubts
to rest and adopted the generally held view that the court could transfer venue by its own motion.

Bankruptcy Rule 1014(a)(2) governs cases filed in an improper district. If filed in an improper
district, the court, on a timely motion by a party in interest or by its own motion, may dismiss the
case or transfer it in the interests of justice or for the convenience of the parties. The primary
difference between filing in a proper or improper district is that if improper, the court can decide to
dismiss the case rather than transfer it to the proper district.4

The second part of Bankruptcy Rule 1014 resolves the potential conflict that arises when petitions
involving the same or related debtors are filed in different courts.5 Bankruptcy Rule 1014(b)
authorizes a court in the district in which the first petition is filed to determine the district or districts
in which the case or cases should proceed. Further, any proceedings in any cases filed after the first
petition has been filed are stayed until the court determines the venue issue.

C. When Is Transfer Appropriate?

Regardless of whether the case was filed in the proper district, when determining whether transfer
of a bankruptcy case is warranted “for the convenience of the parties,” courts have considered,
among others, the following factors:

1. proximity of creditors to the court;

2. proximity of the debtor;

3. proximity of witnesses who are necessary to the administration of the estate;



4. the location of the debtor’s assets;

5. the economic administration of the estate; and

6. the necessity for ancillary administration in the event of liquidation.6

Under the heading “interests of justice,” courts have considered:

1. whether transfer would promote the economic and efficient administration of the
bankruptcy estate;

2. whether the interests of judicial economy would be served by the transfer;

3. whether the parties would be able to receive a fair trial in each of the possible venues;

4. whether either forum has an interest in having the controversies resolved within its
borders;

5. whether the enforceability of any judgment would be affected by the transfer; and

6. whether the plaintiff’s original choice of forum should be disturbed.7

Unless raised by the court sua sponte, Bankruptcy Rule 1014 requires a timely motion of a party in
interest to request transfer of a case. Whether such a motion is timely is a matter within the
discretion of the court.8 The party seeking the venue change bears the burden of proof, which must
be carried by a preponderance of the evidence.9 Further, the debtor’s chosen forum should be given
great deference.10 However, the weight given to a debtor’s chosen forum is diminished when the
choice of forum is not directly related to the operative underlying facts of the case.11 Nonetheless,
the case law indicates that courts are willing to grant transfer motions where the debtor and the
bankruptcy case have limited ties to the chosen district.12

One of the most widely discussed recent examples of the venue-transfer provisions in action is the
In re Winn-Dixie Stores Inc. cases13 that were filed in the Southern District of New York. In  Winn-
Dixie, the debtors filed their cases on Feb. 21, 2005. The first of the 24 debtors to file in those
jointly administered cases was Dixie Stores Inc., a wholly-owned subsidiary of debtor Winn-Dixie
Stores Inc. Dixie Stores Inc. was incorporated in New York on Feb. 9, 2005—less than two weeks
before the cases filed. Of the remaining debtors, 19 were Florida entities, and none were New York
entities. By first filing the Dixie Stores, Inc. case, the other 23 debtors were permitted to file in the
Southern District of New York under § 1408(2) as affiliates of a debtor with a case pending in that
district.

Less than a month later, a creditor, Buffalo Rock Co., filed a motion to transfer the cases to the
Middle District of Florida, Jacksonville Division.14 In its motion to transfer venue, Buffalo Rock
alleged that the debtors’ businesses were centered in, and most creditors and employees were



located in, the southeastern United States, and that the debtors were headquartered in Jacksonville.

Buffalo Rock sought transfer of the cases based on the contention that the debtors improperly
manufactured jurisdiction in the Southern District of New York by incorporating Dixie Stores Inc.
on the eve of the filings. According to Buffalo Rock, the debtors forum-shopped to minimize
creditor involvement in the cases. Accordingly, Buffalo Rock argued that the cases should be
transferred because they were filed in New York in bad faith, or in the alternative, on equitable
grounds. In particular, Buffalo Rock urged the court to consider factors such as the effect of “forum
shopping” on the integrity of the bankruptcy system, New York’s lack of connections to the
debtors, and the convenience of employees and creditors.

Rather than contesting Buffalo Rock’s motion (which was joined in by a small group of other
parties), the debtors filed a responsee15 defending their venue choice, but nonetheless requested a
transfer to the Middle District of Florida. On April 13, 2005, the motion was granted,16 and the
cases were transferred to the Middle District of Florida, Jacksonville Division.17

Similarly, on Oct. 19, 2011, the U.S. Bankruptcy Court for the District of Delaware transferred
venue of the case of In re Rehoboth Hospitality LP d/b/a Logos Plaza Hotel18 to the Northern
District of Texas. In Rehoboth, the debtor, which owns and operates a hotel in Abilene, Texas,
filed its case in Delaware, the state in which it is incorporated. The debtor asserted in its petition
that its principal place of business is Philadelphia because that is where the general partner of the
debtor maintains its office.

Abilene Holdings LLC, the mortgagee of the property on which the debtor’s hotel is located, filed a
motion to transfer venue, asserting, in part, that the debtor’s true principal place of business was
Abilene, Texas, and that transfer was warranted as being in the best interests of justice and more
convenient to the parties. The court found that the presence of most of the debtor’s creditors in
Texas, the court’s inability to exercise subpoena power over most witnesses, the expense of
requiring witnesses to travel from Texas to Delaware, a Texas court’s familiarity with the locale of
the debtor’s real property, and the Delaware court’s overburdened docket favored transfer.

D. Conclusion

The experiences of Winn-Dixie Stores Inc. and Rehoboth, and similar cases, demonstrate the
flexibility of the Judicial Code and the Bankruptcy Rules for dealing with those circumstances
where a debtor may have manufactured a basis for jurisdiction on the eve of filing or where another
district might be the more suitable venue for the bankruptcy case. There are a variety of valid bases
upon which venue will be found to be proper. However, when the question arises of whether
venue may be proper, but other circumstances warrant transfer to a venue where the case may
better be administered, the Judicial Code, the Bankruptcy Rules and the courts, are flexible and



efficient at sorting out these sometimes difficult questions.
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